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The mysteries of the ancient Chinese text known as the I Ching continue to fascinate scholars and enthusiasts
alike. While sinologists rely on historical criticism to explain the meaning of the work, those who use it for
divination tend to accept without question the traditional account of its origin and purpose. Whereas modern
scholars are generally dismissive of the book's reputed mystical significance, traditionalists often resent
academic research into the oracle because it seems irreverent or iconoclastic. In The Mandate of Heaven, S.
J. Marshall sets out to reconcile these opposing approaches. He plumbs the book's numerous, hidden
historical references, reading them against other sources, and discovers that the oracle has far more narrative
integrity and basis in historical fact than anyone has previously appreciated.

The Mandate of Heaven focuses on the story of the I Ching's origins. The book is attributed to King Wen,
who died before he could succeed in overthrowing the tyrannical Shang dynasty. His son, King Wu,
eventually triumphed over the Shang and established the Zhou dynasty as the legitimate royal house.
According to the tradition, these events are in some ways alluded to in the earliest layer of commentary in
the I Ching, but no sound historical basis has been discovered to substantiate this claim. Consequently, since
the 1930s sinologists have discounted the value of this tradition. Marshall uncovers an account of Wu's
conquest in an important, previously overlooked passage that tells of a solar eclipse believed by the King to
have been an omen from Heaven to immediately march against the Shang. Marshall is able to match this
account with a scientifically verified solar eclipse that took place on June 20, 1070 B.C., just one of his many
historical readings that show how the earliest layer of the I Ching has preserved a hidden history that has
remained undetected for three millennia.
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From reader reviews:

Loretta Claybrooks:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your short lived problem;
you can add your knowledge by the book entitled The Mandate of Heaven. Try to face the book The
Mandate of Heaven as your friend. It means that it can to be your friend when you truly feel alone and beside
that of course make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book
makes you far more confidence because you can know almost everything by the book. So , let's make new
experience and also knowledge with this book.

Renee Wood:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be revise about what going on or details even knowledge
to make these people keep up with the era which can be always change and move forward. Some of you
maybe can update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to an
individual is you don't know what one you should start with. This The Mandate of Heaven is our
recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and want in
this era.

Fred Prentice:

The book with title The Mandate of Heaven includes a lot of information that you can understand it. You can
get a lot of benefit after read this book. This specific book exist new understanding the information that exist
in this guide represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to learn how the
improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you within new era of the syndication. You can read
the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Wendy Fuller:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information simpler
to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You can
see that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The book that recommended to your account is
The Mandate of Heaven this guide consist a lot of the information from the condition of this world now. This
book was represented just how can the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer value to
explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made some investigation when he makes this book. That's
why this book ideal all of you.
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