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When The Oxford Guide to Literary Britain and Ireland first appeared, it was hailed by The Times of
London as "the finest reference work of its kind." Now in a new edition, with over 150 more authors and new
feature entries by high-profile authors such as Margaret Drabble and John Sutherland, this beautifully
illustrated, over-sized volume lists hundreds of places in Britain and Ireland and details their connections
with the lives of famous writers.
This popular guide provides more than 200 illustrations of writers, their houses, and the landscapes that
inspired them, as well as a wealth of curious information and entertaining anecdotes. Take a tour of Poets'
Corner, in Westminster Abbey, where you can find Chaucer's canopied tomb, a monument to Shakespeare
with lines from The Tempest, the grave of Dickens, and tablets to Dylan Thomas, T.S. Eliot, and W.H.
Auden, among many others. Read how the Cumbrian Lake District's breathtaking scenery inspired the "Lake
Poets" Wordsworth, Coleridge and Southey, and how Keats' "Ode to a Grecian Urn" was written after he saw
the Athenian sculptures at the British Museum. Walk through Chelsea to see where of A.A. Milne, Mark
Twain, and Bram Stoker lived. Or travel off the beaten path, to Liverpool, for instance, where bankruptcy led
Washington Irving to write the great American classic Rip Van Winkle, or to Muckross, where the author of
Baron Munchausen, himself a spinner of tall tales, conned a landowner into buying property planted with
samples of rich ore, or to Near Sawrey, where Beatrix Potter owned a seventeenth-century farmhouse.
Arranged for easy reference, with maps and an index of writers, The Oxford Guide to Literary Great Britain
and Ireland captures the richness of this great literary heritage.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Cardona:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important thing for
us to learn everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or even goal; it means that guide has
different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They are reading
whatever they acquire because their hobby is actually reading a book. What about the person who don't like
reading a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book once they found difficult problem or even
exercise. Well, probably you will require this The Oxford Guide to Literary Britain and Ireland.

Mary Benoit:

This The Oxford Guide to Literary Britain and Ireland book is simply not ordinary book, you have it then the
world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is definitely information inside this
publication incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper you read a lot of information you
will get. This kind of The Oxford Guide to Literary Britain and Ireland without we comprehend teach the one
who reading it become critical in considering and analyzing. Don't end up being worry The Oxford Guide to
Literary Britain and Ireland can bring if you are and not make your case space or bookshelves' grow to be
full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even phone. This The Oxford Guide to Literary Britain
and Ireland having excellent arrangement in word and also layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in
reading.

Valerie Smith:

Often the book The Oxford Guide to Literary Britain and Ireland will bring you to definitely the new
experience of reading a book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. If you try to find new book
you just read, this book very acceptable to you. The book The Oxford Guide to Literary Britain and Ireland is
much recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book from the official web site, so you can easier
to read the book.

Melody Herrera:

Can you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Aim to
pick one book that you never know the inside because don't determine book by its cover may doesn't work at
this point is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside seem
likes. Maybe you answer is usually The Oxford Guide to Literary Britain and Ireland why because the
wonderful cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint an individual. The inside or
content will be fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly make
suggestions to pick up this book.
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